HH-¥T—16 LT THY-UHoTHoWlo / TeAo—

Eeclo / Tiollo—91 /2014—16
AU T URE YT FRLAS <

QU TE, I 729

- TR U9l @R SR W

STATIOT
Remt uRRe

HAT—1, GoS (H)
(TR daw AfS=HaR)
g%, AR, 6 S-4d%), 2018
giy 16, 1939 I[P THIA

Iedx a9l A
faerll argwTT—1

T 2731 / 79-3-1-17-1(%)-20-17
AEGHE, 6 FHIN], 2018

JferRga

fafae

“YIRE 1 GfquT @ TS 200 @ UM ISTUTE HEIQd 4 S&IN UL SN (W)
fadRre, 2017 WR f3Aid 5 W=ad), 2018 B IJFART FAE B MR g8 Iar uLy AfRew w4
W 2018 B WU H GAARRO & goered 39 JfRgE gRT gt fhar S 2 )

IR U ITEHN (W) fEraE, 2017
(IR uew FMFRM = 4 99 2018) |
[Srar I@R uey fdur guee gT ailRa gan]
dYa wI AEEHN AR 1910 BT SR WA B B ford
siferfas
e RSy @ Jewed af # famfaRed sftfae aamn sren 8-

1-(1) ¥ IMRfEn SEr W AEEHN (HeeE) JfRfEm, 2017 @ W AE R
ST | U
(2) T® 27 Rucrax. 2017 &) U §3M HHSAT AT |

796 RPH adhiniyam 4 2018_Data 6 Vidhatka Folder




IR YUY GO TToie, 6 Wael, 2018

g AT
sferforas

& 4 T
1910 @Y =T
3 & HEHEE

2— YT W AEHR ARFTE, 1910, R amt Hq@ affw @E T B
P g 3 B @ (12) H-

—

(@) Swavs (1) ¥ W “Rifg o T & wWH W e ar fafgr

(@) suEvs (2) fFard fear s,

(M) Gve (4) B W W fr=afafean @ve v fRar smm, serfa—
“(4) BE I AP Yo TR I WHR ARFAT gV AED

sy ey a1 :

3o AW & urT 28 ¥ STURE (3) T (4) R 1 s 2016 @
freprelt T TAgh S |

4—e IRfEm & urT 30 A SwwT (1) @ o A fEfafad W T@r
fean W, arifq -

ufe a8 & 5 fR9ie 1 alid, 2016 W, SR URW IJEHN (TER)
FeRY, 2017 B U ER B e b SeUE WReA Yod, ORI 28 B I
TG Yob FHAT SR |

5—Ho1 JfferTm & R 50 W~

(@) T “IIRM FRAT AT D WA UR Ak WY HIAT AT A

oo ford gRIRT o gam” v&@ & Wi,

(@) w8 T b UNT 60" B WM W YK AT AP YR 60,

g 60% @ &l S |

6—Hel IR & o7 51 F TR PIE I AT B B WM W R
13 N fbar & yerar SES ford guRa fmn 2 o oI wd o “uNT 60"
B WM W = d 3id U 60, URT 60% ¥ fad WU |

7-c affrgw @) a7 52 # ¥R UG 3 ORI 60" B WM W Wk Ud
3 R 60, URT 60%” ¥ fad WG |

8-t A" A grT 53 F TR TI ofF "UNI 60" B WM W I TG
3f® “URT 60, HIRT 60%" Y& f&d WG |

oot ffram N urr 54 ¥ pfEuee @ve @ WM R fEfataa
wfteeToe wvs @ fear SR, st -

“Ofya= 7E & % GURT 60, ORI 60, UINT 61, U 62, U 63, URT 647,
gRT 65, UNT 68 @ N gveg fHEl I aemar Se uaRRl @ AN B
WY P GIRY B R qvey Rl e @ amaww, e G Aftege @
ey A fHur o wHar 2 R T8 & 9= 51 A gRT 52 B DA Heldger g
S Y T Rl arve @1 fAwred, R W e g fea W e @
Y weger g1 Iad FaeE & foR wiliea fasar wma

10-Hot IR A urT 55 B W W FEfaied avr @ @ S,
eIt —

“56 HT] 60 B SUENI (2), URT 60%F, UNT 62, NI 63, TR 64F MR Il
gl @ aefe Rl aoRe @ gERT @ i qvedm P awm, gus kA
wfgan, 1973 @ Jyufrta s B9 1T

1-7a IRFEE A ow 60 & ' W PR g v & R,
et —

“60 (1) & @1 afe g@ AffEw @ agdm R ® FA Fram o
W Jal e Wa R TeeE, WY o1 oW @ SeeEd a,—

(@) fr wes avg & fafa var 8; s

796_RPH_adhinivam 4_2018_Data 6 Vidhaika Folder



IR T RN T9E, 6 S-avl, 2018

(@) 59 s @ g1 63 B A TeBIRT P "Wed awg
&1 URaET FRAT & U IY Heol A [GaT 8; Iqar
. (1) ®&ue AN R HA: g uered ffrmw, 1985 @ i
aresed =@, T W R o Aes oY @ = wole g9 W@
QUGS dlel SiTell YRAG | (B9 Jergan) & oY &) ofaqar ok B
svsd (RH well a1 Sell @ S affer w8t ) @ wus a1 famy
X B, YA
(8) &3 g “gargas, fafatoremer ar semEa A dean
g U g ®, W
() fF vor & B GEE, @I, go, VR a7 SUBR, el
| = ol wed avg @ fafwin @ gaivw & ol wgaa axar @ @
3TN U AT TH Fed F Q@A 8,
(@) =9 e & e orgde ww, wnfta ar @ fee
JrEE, garEdHl, fafmrarer, et @ averR | 38 Ak
g% BCrdl & Sl
®) famy @ woee @ R 50 sRe @ Aaa ¥ g T g
rerar
(S1) o1 61 BN St wn @ o &4 Ae avg &1 fama
PR B; A
(ﬂ)amua%m%aaﬁqﬁmmfrm@ﬁmaﬂﬁmﬁﬁﬁqaﬁ
T g 2, A1 fFAmrerT B
@ SH PREE W Ifsd fhar R o SuEve (F) @ JEhE Rl TR @
Rerfy # <1 ad 9% & Favar & ok ga @ sfed fFar oA o v& g9R s9d
a® & d&ar 8 R fHed ey Ry & sraw 9 gfted e o & &9 ad
% B & §Hal & AR WA FEH @ Ied fFw SR & afied gew At
gRIR A1 9o W, IR O wiewd avg B Hew ¥ g9 Iffrmm ok aged e
R frad ok 3 W el @ ager @ agdiE ww fl aeRe, wfte O
U @ AJER PIUarEl @t g enil @t Seuevia Bl @ IW A W I FTuR W
S oft IS &, 9 Fw T Erfty
() &t @2 g9 ARfEE W agde R M RS oo fad ety
71 39 IRfm 3 e ura el agdi, e @1 N @1 Sooigd ke, )
AIes g P AT FRal 2, Y BREE S B A ¥ FH A8 e R o A
a¥ a® 8 ghal &, &1 qve fadr SR &R I¥ FEH F1 ft qve fear S &
UfE B9R $UY § FH A B 3R O g9 B YU aF B Gl B
@) o P 39 IR T e TR M B fw @ R m
Y & oot IR [HHl HGP avg H ST IR 2, I/ FAH FT v R
SRAT S U B9k SR § FH A8 BN SR O &) 9k ¥U O% &) 9adl 21
" 12— s & uRT e0 @ uvmrg frEfolad amr ggr & S,
It -

"60B—ull By fHdl AEd derf B W I uerf @1 i
e T ¥ Y U dxA 2g A wRa1 @ w1 fafda
g%ﬁmw‘ém@wmaﬁmmﬁm
fifte oy AUTIER USRS @1 A Aed axg @ AT F Iwn B
@ ford won fagpg wRar 8, 99 "I IR & F1 Ay dearar & A
ey PO W R W Suew ovam 8 Rwd wea @
wee ey (Aol U JUEfA A ER [USF A TG AW PE I
a‘?‘aﬁ;qj uRomd aifer gl wwafaa 8, a1 afed fasar smam -

fassy
% o
nf

796 _RPH -adhinivam 4_2018_Data 6 Vidhaika Folder

TE U 60%
B gGTT FATH



4 Ted WS R e, 6 Si-del, 2018

(@) afe Q@ frd B @ weRawd §og w8 A 99
arofiae HREN 3R oA, O o6 g 0 a6 & | &, ]
o eI § o A e, @ R of & B8, -

(@) aft W fred P & worvawy Rparmar a1 g STef B o
@ aToflae BRI ATl FIR BREAK A o a6 a§ aF 8 Fgaw 8 fbeyg
w af ¥ HF 9 B, AR ST | S Ue e W @ 8 WAl E
fohg = oE $UA & &HA | BN

(W)uﬁ@gﬁﬂ%mwmﬁﬁmﬁﬁaﬁaﬁéa%ﬁmaﬁs‘m
qRoT & ugad 8, o Q¥ oy @ @A @ St @ g a@ ) wEd
?,ﬁﬂ@a&@wagﬁmsﬂ?gnﬁﬁ@hamwmm
o 8 wbal & o e og uede FOR $99 [ B A 8|
TG54 URT B FEre U Suefy’ @ O U’ & wef 9f)

2 o 9Iee gue wfedn 1860 (ARITIEH WRET 45 § 1860) B A UIRT 319

g A
S dte

ud 320 A § |
4T 62 Bl 13- SFTE B R 62 § v AT ¥ A W U BWR W a%
e B woal £ TUeE BN B WM W e G | S U g B0 6 A
8 BT SR ol 99 BOR $Ud d@ € wadl &, gveHy B v fl e |
HRT 63 Bl 14 aRfEE B OR 3 @ v W At g @ § S,
BRI 319)1?[%

“s3—uil @ wfi 9 omfrgw a1 9gdE 9 T R frow
sem A @ PY T RN IRY B IeeEd AR AW wU A
sy ST grfad fdl AT § oWed avg @1 uRdgd &gl
PR g e v, 98 W BRA W, W B A 8 @
=81 gnm ik o it af g B waedr 8 iR ol &
aRT 30 & i SIS Yob U WRIGA Yob B weRIf O, AR fHE
Ao aw B Geg 39 gRFEE iRk agd s R A fgE e
@Wﬁ%mmw%wmﬁawﬁzmwaﬁw
PRI @ T A @ serE ad, @ T a1 dfa g vud, W
B o 8, A B9 T8 8 e A s
R 64 B 157 ARFE B aN 64 A WU (M) & i W Frfafea a@ve v
e faan oA, it -
<) ¥ Ae, frd ol aRT 60 H Sua B, 9 e fme e | A
40 TG 41 @ 3T 9 T R PigE @1 SHgE a) JewEd dRdl B 99 Hdd
W ey @ R oA, o Ue BwN vUd @ B AR BRT SR O utE BN
S0 dd 8 "edl B, 9§ fvsa fEar s
&R 64T BI 16— afofras & anT 64 H—

BEICE]

(@) Suurr (1) Fare & S,

(@) SRl (2) § ¥ Gl BOIR WU & XM PR e diE BN
s v@ fed W,

() SR (2) B g W v W W IR B W W g
TR SUA” Tl I Ui @ T @ WM W ¥ T geR Ul %"

&l SR |
M 65 @1 17-7e Jffm @ urT 65 H -
g
(@) SR (1) § T B AR B WM R & CTE a9 q IR
2 EER BUY B WM W Yk “UfE geR $93 @ A S,
(@) SR (2) ¥ e ufg @ W B W W A UE ESR
sl g Rl S
YR 66 @1 1e—Te I @ G166 § wed I e B W R IR CH qU”

GRICE! Gonr Sre g W) BT P W Wy Ui geR ud @ Ry i |

796 RPH_adhimyam 4 2018 Data 6 Vidhaika Folder



I TSI SR 9ie, 6 W-a%], 2018

‘ 19-7a AffFTm 3 aR1 67 § e T W b WM W Uk U gy
o T U UG W BWT B WH R UL U TR R 7w R S
- 20— ARFTEH A aRT 68 H T U@ H TWT b WM W ¥R Ui
EaR U0 g f3 SR
2101 JRfFm & uRT 69 H ver wfoduets @ # e dW At @
WH W IE T q RN TR TH 9 B WE R Ik 9 AV W@ Ry IR
227 AT 9 gRT 69 T F U HER W 3P IR 60 B SUHNI
(1) T SR (2) B wWue (@), Wve (9), @ve (§) U @WUe (B) A 9N 62 B
3 WM W e IR 3k g 60, UIRT 60 P, URT 62, URI 63 Il YRl 65 ¥
o sy
23—9a fefm @ a1 70 H-

(@) Swrr (1) 4, @vs (@) © W[ ® AEfaiead @ve @ R
\—rlTaTTT.GTQTf?[:—
(@) IF@! A AFBR AT FQE A 81 qar B g
e g uRare w1 RUE 9 f&ar oy, gRT 60, T 60 B,
g 62, HRT 63, NI 64 &, HRT 65 T URT 69 @ B IET UG
R ara=Te @1, ar’
(@) SUaRI (2) @ YF W FEfefRaa Swarr w@ @ wRel, serfa—
“(2) TG WHR @ RN Wi » W @ afree, uw
60 & @) IUHRT (&%) TAT (W) Td URT 67 @ 3w B 74 3peray
Sue ford guiRa el srovw @ =1 g9 affam @ adi=
8, @ yzarg ve oy & faw 9 §Rera e s e
24—l ATy & g1 71 H -

(@) T 3R 3 U 607 B WM W UK AR HH IR 60,
gRT 60F " T ey W,

(@) vitEurns @ve & WM R fa=fafed dfoaues wve e
%mmitm,ama;—

‘gfdes gg & % aRT 60% T U1 699 A A @@ &
wfode g gl ff aafle ool @ = i afe &1 At
23 ° =fawn & Ra ora ®f goe [4g] §91 ST |°
25-7a fAfFam & grt 72 § SmuRT (2) @ R W fEfafad suaw
?’@”ﬂﬁ'\?\'ﬂi"ﬁ,&?ﬂfﬁ:_

“(2) WET g9 Affam @ & Suew @ ol fel avg @1 Uy &0
Ffgee P S get N Swfa @ afnEid v g R aren
Aftresrd), V0 IR vd Fega & fR9ie 9 09 o Rew & Wiy,
R o fawga RUle dolder @ wHE HRIG ST | dHeldey JARusy
199 3R afda wafed wfea Saa RUE ora 39 R dosia 91 3
Trfera ifiren afR wverw 8 amew <, o 5 g SR gws) afe
fafaRag Rl o9 918 BROT § FoldeR B 98 SENTE 8 o fF B8
R fn w8 Rred RO WA aw) 91 Uy SUHRl (1) @ A
afERer & 99 &1 <) 8 T R, @ 98 U 9% I 9y B AfOERv
FRA B ST ¢ Fhal & AR U IR $ ford fiare \Rera e
T & W A9 s a8

gfrar g8 2 5 swuw (1) % Pffe R ovg (\@ee awg &
vlgar) a1 0y & Refy § Swae WM @ g8 ey fRar s & ag
e AERY B gac § I9H MYV fHY oM @ feAiw @ 9w
IR e ¥ FfE AT 1 graE &, R Heiger uaia §\we

796_RPH_adminivam 4_2018 Data 6 Vidhaika Folder

YN 67 @T
o 68
g 69 @

HINT 69F Bl

T 70 &7

R 71 &1

=T 72 B
Heye



TN U JFHRY OIS, 6 AN, 2018

g 73 & &
e

YT 74 6T
YA

Nl 74d BT
RSEIT]
e al

J5g ¥ aiforsg &) faurT & uvar IneeR) fadr guw wew g1 fawr €1 gy 201617
HAHT RBurT g1 A7IF 14,272 BRe WUA Suiiia B3 1 9 waast # fuiRe @e & ane @
o Wit g2 o | Sa B B g e yerd e, faRivee sRan @ sy afewr @ o)
of) | I YR A W ¥ ady wlew @ o @ 9 dadt v @ IorE A aft g8 ot avq U
3y dorl Wl AR B TUWAT @ FR SE-ollgd @) afd & gead R gkl off | e wHal
Q wEfg WA weel AR o wEnel @1 [aRw axa @ Iqew 9 ge Rfvvgn o g e

Ferfg—

26—7c1 I 3 a1 73 & 3 W R FrEfafed gr @ @ e,

-

“73h—GTEl I 72 T °RT 73 & A BIE HdD 9] 6 IR0 [FUl -

g, agt el e g 9w v A M R adw @ eraE,
fE delger &) A H RO H T Ted avg AHd SN A 48 B
JUal afe el @ TR wee avg w1 e Ty ufRfda w8
S FEHAT & @ ae g9 affrm ¥ safde B e @ afame & g
Iq qEH a¥g D) T B TH B e T FaHE @

ufde= a8 2 fF S wes avg & AR 5 9™ 3 fais 9 Q)
o B W @ uTgg @ Rar @ wEr ANERn & ARy & favE
gAfdeted o el odid 2g amdew-u3, $9 =™ d 08 yAfderes @
afier % oG eyl & FWR & fHary affed 8, T 781 favar S -

IeR wiies ¥g 2 &% 39 N1 @ i "ies o] T Ry S gg
B3 ey, I9 Afdd, Rradd siffrer & wes oy v o mar &)
B 7 T @ Afew @ yTAq GAag @& saeR wer By e gk e
farar

g o2 N & 5 Ae avg @ waia T @iias ardema @l
ufd & ford ufRfem e sy
27—9@ s & gy 74 A -

(@) SuuR (1) § v U NN JUY’ @ WM W & TEd
g9 Ul e 2y @
(@) Juamg (1-) H—
9 U4 AER GUS () B AT B WM W TR UG HER
"@ug (F) aul (@) & FdF T A e,
o gERg BYA ol O G $Ud Od 8 ghd) & P WH W
v U R B0 Gl Ufg g9k vUd OF B HaHa 8 @ {3
ST |
28—qa A @ ur 743 H Fuww (1) A e UiE E9R I B

WM W ¥ UdH ang SR v @l S

29—(1) SR USY HEHN (W) IJRARY, 2017 TEAGERI SR W

iy ey Wi 2 ey

HEgT 1

(2) W& s @ &0 gy N S (1) # fAfde weake R g 500

g1 Wl wE afdfram @ Suedt @ wefE od @13 e A @ T
B Hrdad), 3@ ADfam g g WM e sfeftaw @ we
geaeft Suget & aflm @ @ @) T wws oA Tl gw arfafram
@ Iudy W) wRaE w9d J vga o |

IgaeT AR R

Hgad ww SEEn AffE 1010 # WA eve g@ad: e sue R o

(1) Soa aftfram & 2fbe® Suawl @1 sMenha Afos Fer fEar ST

796 RPH_adhiniyam 4 2018 Data 6 Vidhaika Folder



TR WSE IJHEERY TolC, 6 SiaR], 2018 7
(2) URher BT B! IUE Yob & WU H a¥el b BT Iue fbal S,
(3)3ene vew @ Ffwan G § wEfug Suasl @ e 1 b, 2016 § wH
fea s
(4) wmos MR ek wEmd uenf aftfrriees d wfafad fhr W @ www
WWW@WJ%O%W@W@W&HWWWW;
(5) wiftsw arvelf # SR &1 Aftafea fhar o |
qﬁﬁwﬁwwwﬁﬂﬁwaﬁ?ﬁaﬂﬁﬁwaﬁmaﬂﬁa%ﬁﬁw
et BRIAE S AEUEE o, He: VSUuld g feAid 27 fEER, 2017 @ SR YSH
STEFT (WIEH) AR, 2017 (IR FF AeATCY A 1 W 2017) A fhar |
78 fege gatad searew ® ufeRenfie @ve @ R wenfa faar s 2 |
TS 9,

AR5 HAR AR,
g wfa |

}

No. 2731(2YLXX1X-V-1-17-1(ka)-20-17 Py
Dated Lucknow, January 6,2018

IN pursuance of the provisions of clause (3) of Article 348 of the Constitution, the Governor is
pleased to order the publication of the following English translation of the Uttar Pradesh Aabkari
(Sanshodhan) Adhiniyam, 2017 (Uttar Pradesh Adhiniyam Sankhya 4 of 2018) as passed by the Uttar
Pradesh Legislature and assented to by the Governor on January 5, 2018.

THE UTTAR PRADESH EXCISE (AMENDMENT) ACT. 2017
(U.P. ACT NO. 4 OF 2018)
[As passed by the Uttar Pradesh Legislature]
AN
ACT

further to amend the United Provinces Excise Act, 1910.

IT IS HEREBY enacted in the Sixty-eighth Year of the Republic of India as follows:-

1. (1) This Act may be called the Uttar Pradesh Excise (Amendment) Act, 2017. Short title and

; & t
(2) It shall be deemed to have come into force on September 27, 2017. ommeneemen

2. In section 3 of the United Provinces Excise Act, 1910 hereinafter referred to as  Amendment of
o A ) section 3 of
the principal Act, in clause (12), UP Actno 4

(a) in sub-clause (i) for the words "Sidhi or Ganja" the words "or sidhi"  of 1910
shall be substituted,
(b) sub-clause (ii) shall be omirted:;
() for clause (iv) the following clause shall be subsrituted, namely:-
"(iv) any other intoxicating substance which the State Government
may by notification declare to be an intoxicating drug:".
3. In section 28 of the principal Act, sub-sections (3) and (4) shall be deemed to ~ Amendment of
have been omitted from April 1, 2016. Sectinn.23
4. In section 30 of the principal Act, in sub-section (1) the following proviso shall ~Amendment of
be inserted at the end, namely:— section 30
"Provided that consideration fee levied from 01 April. 2016 upto the date of
commencement of the Uttar Pradesh Excise (Amendment) Ordinance. 2017 shall be
deemed to be Excise Duty under section 28".

796 RPH_adhiniyam 4 2018 Data 6 Vidhaika Folder



8

IEN U N T9E, 6 -9, 2018

Amendment
of section 50

Amendment
of section 51

Amendment
of section 52

Amendment
of section 53

Amendment
of section 54

Amendment
of section 55

Amendment
of section 60

5. In section 50 of the principal Act, -
(a) for the words "committing an offence"the words "committing or abett" g h
an offence"shall be substituted ; -
(b) for the word and figures "section 60"the words and figures "section v,
section 60A" shall be substituted

6. In section 51 of the principal Act for the words "committed any offence"the
words "committed or abetted any offence” and for the word and figures "section 60" the
words and figures "section 60, section 60A" shall be substiruted.

7. In section 52 of the principal Act for the words and figures "section 60" the
words and figures "section®60, section 60A" shall be substituted.

8. In section 53 of the principal Act for the words and figures "section 60" the
words and figures "section 60, section 60A" shall be substituted.

9. In section 54 of the principal Act for the proviso the following proviso shall be
substituted, namely:-

"Provided that an offence punishable under section 60, section 60A. section 61,
section 62, section 63, section 64-A, section 65, section 68 or an offence punishable for
abetment of any offence under the said sections may be investigated into without the order of a
Magistrate, and that any warrant issued by the Collector under section 51 or section 52 may be
executed by any officer authorised by the Collector for the said purpose."

10. For section 55 of the principal Act the following section shall be substituted,
namely:-

"55. All offences punishable under sub-section (2) of section 60, section 60A,
section 62, section 63, section 64-A and any offence punishable for abetment of any
offence under the said sections, shall be non-bailable within the meaning of the Code of
Criminal Procedure, 1973."

1. For section 60 of the principal Act the following section shall be substituted,
namely:- L9,

"60. (1) Whoever, in Contravention of this Act or of any rule or order made
thereunder. or of any licence, permit or pass obtained thereunder:—

(a) exports any intoxicant; or

(b) transports or possesses any intoxicant which is not covered under
section 63 of this Act; or

(c) collects or sells the leaves and small stalks (not accompanied by
flowering or fruiting tops) of natural and spontaneous growth of wild Indian

Hemp plant (Cannabis Sativa) other than charas, ganja or any other intoxicating

drug covered under the Narcotic Drugs and Psychotropic Substances Act, 1985;

or

(d) constructs or works any distillery, brewery, manufactory or vintnery: or

(e) uses, keeps or has in his possession any material, still, utensil,
implement or apparatus, whatsoever, for the purpose of manufacturing any
intoxicant other than tari; or

(f) removes any intoxicant from any distillery, brewery, manufactory,
vintnery or warchouse licenced, established or continued under this Act; or

(g) bottles any liquor for the purposes of sale; or

(h) sells any intoxicant, save in the case provided for by section 61; or

(i) taps. or draws tari from any tari-producing tree in the areas notified
under section 42 ;

shall be punished with imprisonment which may extend to two years and with

fine which may extent to one thousend rupees in the case of an offence under sub

clause (i) and in any other case, with imprisonment which may extend to three
years and with fine which shall, not be less than ten times of the amount of
consideration fee or duty which would have been leviable if such intoxicant had
been dealt with in accordance with this Act and the rules and orders made

796 _RPH_adiimyam 4 2018 Data 6 Vidhaika Folder



IR U9 IR THE, 6 a9, 2018

thereunder or in accordance with any licence, permit or pass obtained
thereunder, or two thousand rupees whichever is greater.
(2) Whoever in contravention of this Act or any rule or order made thereunder
or of any licence, permit or pass, obtained under this Act, manufactures any intoxicant
shall be punished with imprisonment which shall not be less than six months and which
may extend to three years and also with fine which shall not be less than five thousand
rupees and which may extend to ten thousand rupees.

(3) Whoever, in contravention of this Act, or any rule or order made thereunder,
consumes any intoxicant, shall be punished with fine wh:ich shall not be less than one
thousand rupees and which may extend to two thousand rupees."

12. After section 60 of the principal Act the following section shall be inserred,

.

namely:-

"60A. Whoever, adulterates or causes to be adulterated any intoxicant
;ﬁ’;?l]l‘g for by mixing any other substance or foreign ingredient to make
noxious such intoxicant noxious or sells, offers or makes or causes to be

substance with - 414 or offered or made available such noxious intoxicant or any
intoxicant and

selling of other noxious substance for consumption in the garb of an
:3;‘;;‘;5; . intoxicant, likely to cause disability or hurt or grievous hurt or
under the garb ~ death or any other consequential injury to humanbeings, shall be
of intoxicant punished;

(a) if as a result of such an act, death is caused, with death or
imprisonment for life and shall also be liable to fine which may extend to ten
lakh rupees but shall not be less than five lakh rupees;

(b) if as a result of such an act, disability or grievous hurt is caused, with
imprisonment for life or rigorous imprisonment which may extend to ten years
but shall not be less than six years and with fine which may extent to five lakh
rupees but shall not be less than three lakh rupees;

(c) if as a result of such an act, any hurt or any other consequential injury
is caused to any person, with imprisonment for a term which may extend to two
years but shall not be less than one year and fine which may extend to two lakh
fifty thousand rupees but shall not be less than one lakh twenty five thousand
rupees.

Explanation:~ For the purpose of this section the expression "hurt and
grievous hurt" shall have the same meaning as in section 319 and section 320
respectively of the Indian Penal Code, 1860 (Act no. XLV of 1860)."

13. In section 62 of the principal Act for the words "liable to fine which may
extend to five thousand rupees" the words "liable to fine which shall not be less than five

thousand rupees and which may extend to ten thousand rupees.” shall be substituted
14. For section 63 of the principal Act the following section shall be substituted,
namely:-
"63. Whoever, in contravention of this Act, or of any rule or order made
Penalty for thereunder, imports any intoxicant or transports or has in his
;’;‘:::tﬁ;‘f possession any quantity of any intoxicant unlawfully imported,
intoxicant and Shall be punished with imprisonment which shall not be less
transportor  than six months and which may extend to five years and also
gg?:f:;:ﬁ; °f with fine which shall not be less than ten times the amount of
imported excise duty or consideration fee under section 30 which would
intoxicanterc. have been leviable if such intoxicant had been dealt with in
accordance with this Act and the rules and orders made
thereunder or in accordance with any license, permit or pass
obtained thereunder or five thousand rupees whichever is greater."

796_RPH_adhiniyam 4_2018_Data 6 Vidhaika Folder

Insertion of
new section
60A

Amendment of
section 62

Amendment of
section 63



10

I TS IR TiE, 6 W-as], 2018

Amendment of
section 64

Amendment of
section 64-A

Amendment of
section 63

Amendment of
section 66

Amendment of
section 67

Amendment of
section 68

Amendment of
section 69

Amendment of
section 69-A

Amendment of
section 70

Amendment of
section 71

15. In section 64 of the principal Act for clause( c) the following clause shall
be substituted, namely:- -

"(c) save in a case provided for by section 60, willfully contravenes any w
rule made under sections 40 and 41 shall, for each such offence, be punished
with fine which shall not be less than one thousand rupees and which may
extend to five thousand rupees."

16. In section 64-A of the principal Act,-
(a) sub-section (1) shall be omirted;
-(b) in sub-section(2) for the words "two thousand rupees" the words
"five thousand rupees" shall be substituted,
(c) in the proviso to sub-section (2) for the words "two hundred rupees”
the words "two thousand rupees" and for the words "five hundred rupees"” the
words "three thousand rupees" shall be substituted.

17. In section 65 of the principal Act,-

(a) in sub-section (1) for the words "six months" the words "one year"
and for the words "two thousand rupees” the words "five thousand rupees”
shall be substituted.

(b) in sub-section (2) for the words "five hundred rupees" the words
"one thousand rupees" shall be substituted.

18. In section 66 of the principal Act for the words "three months" the words
"one year" and for the words "five hundred rupees" the words "five thousand rupees”
shall be substituted.

19. In section 67 of the principal Act for the words "three months" the words
"one year" and for the words "five hundred rupees" the words "five thousand rupees”
shall be substituted.

20. In section 68 of the principal Act for the words "five hundred rupees" the
word "five thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

21. In section 69 of the principal Act, in the first proviso for the words "three
months" the words "one year", and for the words "one year" the words "two years"
shall be substituted.

22. In section 69-A of the principal Act for the words letters and figures
"clause (b), clause (d), clause ( €) or clause (g) of sub-section (1) or of sub-section (2)
of section 60 or of section 62" the words and figures "section 60, section 60-A,
section 62, section 63 or of section 65" shall be substituted.

23. In section 70 of the principal Act,-
(a) in sub-section (1) for clause (a) the following clause shall be
substituted, namely:-
"(a) of an offence punishable under section 60, section 60-A,

section 62, section 63, section 64-A, section 65 or section 69-B,

except on his own knowledge or suspicion or on the complaint or report

of an Excise Officer; or"

(b) for sub-section (2) the following sub-section shall be substituted,

namely:-

"(2) Except with the special sanction of the State Government no
Magistrate shall take cognizance of any offence punishable under this Act
other than an offence committed or abetted under sub-sections (a) and
(b) of section 60-A and section 67, unless the prosecution is instituted
within a year after the date on which the offence is alleged to have been -
committed. "

24. In section 71 of the principal Act.-

(a) for the word and figures "section 60" the words and figures
"section 60, section 60-A" shall be substituted,

796_RPH_adhinivam 4_2018_Data 6 Vidhaika Folder



ook WeYl IERNY TSle, 6 WHdv], 2018

11

(b) for the proviso the following proviso shall be substituted, namely:-

"Provided that, notwithstanding anything to the contrary in
sections 60A and 69B, no person other than the actual offender shall be
punished with imprisonment except in default of payments of fine."

25. In section 72 of the principal Act for sub-section (2) the following
sub-section shall be substituted, namely:-

"(2) Where anything or animal is seized under any provision of this Act, the
officer seizing and detaining such property shall, within three working days
from the date of such seizure and detention; produce a detailed report for
confiscation alongwith such seized property, seizure memo and other relevant
documents before the Collector. The Collector shall, upon receiving the said
report alongwith seizure memo and seized property, immediately order for safe
custody and storage of goods as he may deem fit. The Collector, if satisfied for
reasons to be recorded that an offence has been committed due to which such thing or
animal has become liable to confiscation under sub-section (1), he may order
confiscation of such thing or animal whether or not a prosecution for such offence has
been instituted:

Provided that in the case of anything (except an intoxicant) or animal referred
to in sub-section (1), the owner thereof shall be given an option to pay in lieu of its
confiscation such fine as the Collector thinks adequate, not exceeding its market value
on the date of its seizure."”

26. For section 73-A of the principal Act the following section shall be
substituted, namely:-

"73-A Where any intoxicant is confiscated under section 72 or section 73,
the Coilector. may, subject to any order passed in that benalf by anv court if in
his opinion the confiscated intoxicant is not fit for human consumption or if
the confiscated intoxicant cannot be stored or preserved, order the intoxicant
to be destroyed notwithstanding anything to the contrary comntained in this Act:

Provided that the intoxicant shall not be destroved except afier expiration
of two months fiom the date of confiscation or where an application for review
or an appeal against the order of confiscation is pending except in accordance
with the order passed in such, review or appeal in this regard:

Provided further that any order for destruction of the intoxicant under
this section shall not be passed without providing opportunity of hearing
after notice of seven days to the person from whose custody the intoxicant
1s recovered:

Provided also that adequate sample of the intoxicant shall be preserved to
meet the evidentiary requirements."

27. In section 74 of the principal Act,—
(a) in sub-section (1) for the words "five thousand rupees" the words
"fifty thousand rupees"” shall be substitured,
(b) in sub-section (I-A).-
(i) for the words and letter "under clause (a)" the words and letters
"under clauses (a) and (b)" shall be substituted:

(ii) for the words "fifty rupees which may extend to three hundred
rupees” the words "one thousand rupees which may extend to five
thousand rupees" shall be substituted.

796_RPH_adhimyam 4_2018 Data 6 Vidhaika Folder

Amendment of
section 72

Amendment of
section 73A

Amendment of
section 74



2 Il Uy IMRINY THe, 6 W+ayl, 2018

Atfiendment of 28. In section 74-A of the principal Act, in sub-section (1) for the
SRR words "five thousand rupees” the words "one lakh rupees” shall be -
substituted. -
Repeal and saving 29. (1) The Uttar Pradesh Excise (Amendment) Ordinance, 2017 is U P
hereby repealed. ,?;d;n:? *
2017

(2) Notwithstanding such repeal, anything done or any action
taken under the provisions of the principal Act as amended by the
Ordinance referred to in sub-section (1) shall be deemed to have been
done or taken under the coresponding provisions of the principal Act as
amended by this Act as if the provisions of this Act were in force at all
material times.

STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS

The Excise Department is the second largest department after Commercial Tax Department in the
State. In the year 2016-2017 Rupees 14,272 crore only were earned by the Excise Department. In the
previous years the revenue receipt had been reduced relatively to the target fixed. The main reason for the
said reduction was the smuggling of illegal liquor from the neighboring States particularly from Haryana.
Similarly, the extraction of illegal liquor in the State has caused not only the loss of the revenue of the
State but also incidents of the loss of lives of the people due to the consumption of such illegal and
poisonous liquor. In order to prevent such incidents and other problems relating to the excise matters it has
been decided to amend the United Provinces Excise Act, 1910 mainly to provide for,-
(1) making the penal provisions of tﬁe said Act more stringent;
(2) making provisions for realising consideration fee as Excise duty;
(3) abolishing the provisions relating to the maximum limit of Excise duty with effect from
April 1, 2016;
(4) omitting the provisions relating to Charas and Ganja from the United Provinces Excise
Act, 1910 because of their inclusion in the Narcotic Drugs and Psychotropic Substances
Act, 1985;
(5) including the abetment in the penal offences.

Since the State Legislature was not in session and immediate legislative action was necessary to
implement the aforesaid decision, the Uttar Pradesh Excise (Amendment) Ordinance, 2017 (U.P.
Ordinance no. 1 of 2017) was promulgated by the Governor on September 27, 2017.

2. This Bill is introduced to replace the aforesaid Ordinance accordingly.

By order,
VIRENDRA KUMAR SRIVASTAVA,
Pramukh Sachiv.

FlouE0g0E0—Tot0 796 ITTUF—(B)—2018—(2501)—599 FIT—(FHFgeR /A / AMHHT) |
GlovEogedio—godio 157 @0 faemdl—2018—(2502)-300 YRITI—(FgeR /T / ITHHT) |

796 RPH_adhimyam 4 _201% Data 6 Vidhaika Folder



